Evesham Township Fire District Number 1
County of Burlington

State of New Jersey

Resolution Number 2024 - 45

A RESOLUTION AWARDING A CONTRACT FOR MAIN STREET FIRE
STATION REPAVING PROJECT

WHEREAS, pursuant to the provision of the New Jersey Local Public Contracts
Law (N.J.S.A. 40A:11-1 et seq.) the Fire District’s Qualified Purchasing Agent did
advertise for, receive and open in public bids for Main Street Station Repaving Project on
September 17, 2024; and,

WHEREAS, one (1) bid was so received from the following bidder:

EVESHAM FIRE DISTRICT MAIN STREET STATION

BID SUMMARY
SEPTEMBER 17, 2024 AT 1:00PM REPAVING PROJECT
ENVIRONMENTAL RESOLUTIONS 22800 03
=
& Engneers Extimate Thk Pavers Corstruct Comnect Dlamand Construcaon
3825 Edwards Road. STE #700 125 Kings Highway 3825 Edwards Road. STE 4700 || 35 Beaverson Bivil. STE #12C
ﬂ Cncna. OH 45209 My Royal, NJ 06081 Cancnatt, OH 45206 Brok NJ 08723
mrr Cm— A T
P- (800) 384-2058 P- (850)-832-3680 F. (800) 264-2050 P- (732) 202.7440
F- (800) 570-8187 F- {350) 8324691 F- (B0) 5708187 F- (732) 262-T7%5
NO DESCRIFTION | SUIANTITY] WiT LNIT PR AMOUNT UNTPR AMOUNT UNTPR. | AMOUNT UNIT PR 1 AMOUNT
BASE BID
1 |Miing, 02" Thek nsol sy $9 50 $26,125 00 $4.00 $11,000 00 5 5 s
2 [HMA 12 5MB4 Swrface Course, 2° Thick 3650 TN $130.00 $47,450.00 595,00 $34,675.00 s s $
2 »]
3 |Base Repai 138] sy $30.00 §4,050 00 $20.00 $2.700 00 s s s
4 |Remove & Park B al uN $500.00 $4,000.00 $50.00 $400.00 s < s
5 |Long-Life Traffic Paint Stnping, Base Bkt 1 Ls | $7.50000 | $7.50000 | $48.00000 | $48.00000 f g s s
ALTERNATE EID NO. 1
A1.1 | Miting. 0°-2" Thick a70| sy $9 50 $4,465.00 $4.00 $1.88000 IS s 5
212|HMA 12 5M64 Surface Course, 2* Thick 78| TN | S1P000 | saTS000 $9500 | S7.12500 |5 s s
A1.3 |Long-Life Traffic Paint Stnping, Altemate Bid 1| LS $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $6.000.00 $6.000.00 5 S 5
IALTERNATE BID NO. 2
A1.1|Slurry Seal Coat. Existmg Paving 470| SY S50 $2,55.00 $11.00 $5.17000 | s s
13 |Long-Life Traffic Paint Striping, Altemate Bid 1l s | s2350000 | s250000 || 51180000 | $11.80000 |5 $ s
TOTAL BASE BID PRICE] $89,125.00 $96,775.00 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL ALTERNATE 81D NO.1 $16,715.00 $15,005.00 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL ALTERNATE BID HO.24 $5,085.00 $16,970.00 NO BID NO BID

WHEREAS, Think Pavers Hardscaping submitted the lowest qualified bid with
alternate bid #1 in the amount of $111,780.00;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Board of Fire
Commissioners of the Evesham Township Fire District Number 1 as follows:

1. That a contract by and between the Evesham Township Fire District No. 1 and
Think Pavers Hardscaping of 125 Kings Highway, Mt. Royal, NJ 08061 in the amount
of $111,780 be and is hereby authorized and approved for the Main Street Station

Repaving Project.



Brifn R we, Vice President

This is to certify that the foregoing Resolution was duly adopted by the Board of
Fire Commissioners of the Evesham Township Fire District No. 1 at a meeting held on
the fifteenth day of October 2024.

Secretary of the Board
Roll Call of Vote
Commissioner Moved Seconded Ayes Nays Abstained Absent
Baugh J/ v
Guerrini v/
Powers 4 /
Rowe 4




